
STATE OF ALABAMA

ST. CLAIR COUNTY

The City Council of the City of Pell City met in a work session at the City Hall at 5:30 p.m. on Monday, November 27, 2017.  Present were Council President James McGowan, Councilmen Jay Jenkins, Blaine Henderson, Jason Mitcham and Jud Alverson.  Council President McGowan opened the meeting for discussion.

The invocation was led by City Attorney John Rea.
The pledge to the American Flag was led by City Manager Brian Muenger.
The City Clerk had roll call for attendance. 

Councilman Alverson reviewed the bills on file and everything was in order.

There were no comments on the minutes of the regular council meeting held on October 23, 2017.

Street Superintendent Greg Gossett updated the council on the Cogswell Industrial Park Grading project.  He presented photos showing the work that had been done in clearing the property.  The topsoil that was removed from this property was moved to the Avondale property to make a greenspace.  In some places on the Industrial Park property, there was at least 1½’ of topsoil.
City Manager Muenger presented a contract with Neel-Schaffer for civil design services on the primary access point at the Civic Center.  The plans have been submitted to ALDOT and the City has received two rounds of comments from ALDOT.  He addressed those comments and submitted the permit for the access point which will now go to the Division Office and Montgomery for review.  Mr. Muenger stated that the actual design of the parking lot and the placement of the tennis building have now shifted to where the tennis building will be placed in the existing parking lot.  Even though the City will be losing parking spaces here, it will not be an issue if we are picking up parking spaces with the addition of the secondary lot.
City Manager Muenger presented a revised agreement with Brad Wisener regarding the Hazelwood property appraisals.  Mr. Muenger stated that the project was initiated in 2013 and the City was tasked with paying for the appraisals.  The City had contracted with Mr. Wisener at that time.  During the design phase, the City determined that it needed to acquire right-of-ways on two additional tracts of property.  
A Memorandum of Understanding with St. Clair County for the use of the County’s GIS Systems and Services was presented for discussion.  City Clerk Penny Isbell explained that the County’s GIS System and the GIS Systems of other Municipalities within the County were overlapping.  The City was already working with the County using their GIS.  The County just upgraded their software and hardware for the system so they were asking each municipality to sign an MOU.  Each municipality will be responsible for inputting and maintaining their own information.
City Manager Muenger presented a list of items to be declared surplus.  On the list was a Crown Victoria with 185,000 miles on it from the Police Department.  Other items on the list were picnic tables and benches from the Park & Rec Department.
Park & Rec Director Bubba Edge addressed council regarding the creation and appointment of members to the Park & Rec Advisory Board.  Mr. Edge stated that he, along with Athletic Director Elliot Jacobik, had discussed this with City Manager Muenger a few weeks back.  Mr. Jacobik stated that they drafted the policies and procedures for the council’s consideration.  Mr. Edge stated that the Board would serve as a resource for the Park & Rec staff and allow citizen input.  The Board would help to mobilize volunteers and help with evaluations.  Their plans are to hold meetings either monthly or quarterly.  The City would still handle sports registrations but would still like assistance from the citizens.  Mr. Edge and Mr. Jacobik also drafted a list with the names of potential candidates to serve on the Board.  They will reach out to these citizens to see if they are willing to serve before they are appointed.  Mr. Edge stated that the Board would help the City to address issues at the park by giving their perspective on things.  Councilman Jenkins stated that he would like two representatives from each sport.  Mr. Edge stated that he would like the members to be involved in multiple sports. 
Mr. Edge stated that three companies were solicited for bids on concession supplies for the Park & Rec Department as well as posting the bid solicitations on the website.  Only one bid was received and that was from Gordon Food Supplies.  They are a local company opening in the Industrial Park.  Mr. Edge stated that they had found other ways to save money on the supplies.  Most of the candies could be purchased from Sam’s Club at a significantly lower price.  Mr. Muenger stated that even though the council may approve to award the bid, they were not obligated to purchase all of the items that were on the bid specs. 
Bids were received as follows on the Street and Utility Department vehicles.  The specs were written so that the bids could be individually awarded.  Town & Country Ford was the lowest bidder on the F150, F250 & F350 with the 5% local preference.  Sunny King Ford was the lowest bidder on the F450.  
	
	 F-150 
	 F-250 
	 F-350 
	 F-450 
	MODEL

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Buster Miles Ford
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Long Lewis Ford
	 $  20,469.00 
	 $  33,269.00 
	 $  33,469.00 
	 $  47,496.00 
	2018

	
	 x 5% = $21,492.45 
	 x 5% = $34,932.45 
	 x 5% = $35,142.45 
	 x 5% = $49,870.80 

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Ronnie Watkins Ford
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Stivers Ford/Lincoln
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Sunny King Ford
	 $  20,316.00 
	 $  34,125.34 
	 $  34,108.84 
	 $  47,025.80 
	2018

	
	 x 5% = $21,331.80 
	 x 5% = $35,831.61 
	 x 5% = $35,814.29 
	 x 5% = $49,377.09 

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Tallassee Automotive 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Town & Country Ford
	 $  21,069.00 
	 $  33,157.00 
	 $  34,338.00 
	 $  40,225.00 
	2018

	
	
	
	
	 BID WITHDRAWN-NON COMPLIANT 

	Woody Anderson Ford
	 RECEIVED LATE 
	 RECEIVED LATE 
	 RECEIVED LATE 
	 RECEIVED LATE 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	


Finance Director Teri St. James stated that quotes were solicited from six financial institutions for the financing of the new Police, Fire and Street Department vehicles.  The lowest interest rate quoted was from BB&T at 2.05%.  The first monthly payment would not be due until December 2018.  The vehicles would be used as collateral.  With the timing of the delivery of the vehicles, the money would be put in escrow and paid out when the vehicles were delivered.
Fire Chief Burdette stated that the City was awarded a $4,000.00 grant with a $1,000.00 match to purchase weather radios for residents.  They will be able to purchase approximately 200 radios at $24.90 each.  Fire Department personnel will program the radios for the citizens on two separate Saturdays.  To receive a radio, proof of residency will need to be provided.  Chief Burdette also stated that on December 1st, Pell City becomes an ISO 2 rating.  Chief Burdette also informed the council that the new pumper is five weeks behind schedule.  They should receive it around the last week of February.
Bids were received on the Industrial Access Road Improvements under Project# IAR 058-000-006.  At this time, the City had not received authorization to award the bid.  City Manager Muenger stated that he would like the council to call a special meeting on Wednesday or Thursday in order to award the bid.  This would keep the project on schedule.  Council agreed to hold a special called meeting at 4:30 on Thursday, November 30th.  If authorization is not received by Thursday, the meeting would be cancelled.
City Manager Muenger stated that during budget meetings, council discussed setting aside funds for capital improvement projects.  Council had agreed to set aside 3% of the City’s sales tax revenue along with the tobacco tax.  Sales tax should generate approximately $240,000.00 annually and the tobacco tax approximately $190,000.00 annually after administrative costs.  
City Manager Muenger presented an Ordinance adjusting water and sewer rates based on the feedback from the Public Hearing held on November 20th.  Mr. Muenger stated that there would be an initial 10% increase effective after January 1, 2018 with a 3% increase in subsequent years.  A separate ordinance addressed the Water Capital Recovery and Sewer Impact Fees.  These fees were adjusted based on comments and feedback from homebuilders and developers.
City Manager Comments:  City Manager Muenger updated everyone on the theater project.  The building permit had been sold and temporary construction power had been approved.  The construction trailer was in place and he was happy to see them there.  Mr. Muenger also stated that the McSweeney project was moving along.
Mayor Comments:  Mayor Pruitt reiterated that they had started on the theater today. 
There being no further items to discuss, Council President McGowan adjourned the work session.

The City Council of the City of Pell City met in a regular council meeting at the City Hall at 7:00 p.m. on Monday, November 27, 2017.  Present were Council President James McGowan, Councilmen Jay Jenkins, Blaine Henderson, Jason Mitcham and Jud Alverson.  Those present constituting the entirety of the council, the following business was transacted:

The City Clerk had roll call for attendance.

Councilman Mitcham made a motion to Suspend the Rules in order to amend the agenda.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Henderson and unanimously approved by the council.  On roll call, those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved.

Councilman Jenkins made a motion to add the following item to the agenda.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Henderson and unanimously approved by the council.  On roll call, those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved.
· Introduce ORDINANCE NO. 2017 – 4846 amending the water and sewer rates.

On motion of Councilman Alverson, seconded by Councilman Henderson, the council unanimously approved the payment of bills on file.

On motion of Councilman Henderson, seconded by Councilman Mitcham, the council unanimously approved the minutes of the regular council meeting held on October 23, 2017.

On motion of Councilman Mitcham, seconded by Councilman Alverson, the council unanimously approved the following resolution approving a contract with Neel-Schaffer for civil design services at the Civic Center.

RESOLUTION NO. 2017 - 4834

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY OF PELL CITY TO ENTER INTO A PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AGREEMENT 
WITH NEEL-SCHAFFER, INC.


WHEREAS, to aid and improve public safety, the City Council of the City of Pell City desires to retain professional traffic engineering and planning services for the expansion of the west parking lot, entrance roadway modifications, park entrance closure, additional parking at the park entrance, east parking area overlay and drainage improvements at the Pell City Lakeside Park; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is wise, prudent and in the best interests of the citizens of Pell City to enter into a professional services agreement with Neel-Schaffer, Inc. to provide said professional services for the City.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City, Alabama, as follows:

Section 1.
That the City Manager be, and he hereby is, authorized to enter into a professional services agreement in form and substance as the agreement attached hereto as Exhibit A, and expressly incorporated herein by reference, with Neel-Schaffer, Inc. in an amount not to exceed $25,500.00 to provide professional traffic engineering and planning services for the expansion of the west parking lot, entrance roadway modifications, park entrance closure, additional parking at the park entrance, east parking area overlay and drainage improvements at the City’s Lakeside Park pending review and final approval by the City Attorney.

On motion of Councilman Jenkins, seconded by Councilman Mitcham, the council unanimously approved the following resolution approving an agreement with Bradley Wisener, Wisener, LLC, regarding the Hazelwood property appraisals.
RESOLUTION NO. 2017 - 4835
A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY OF

PELL CITY TO ENTER INTO A PROFESSIONAL

SERVICES AGREEMENT WITH WISENER, LLC
WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has experienced significant growth along Veterans Parkway with the construction of Jefferson State Community College, St. Vincent’s St. Clair Hospital, and the Robert L. Howard State Veterans Home; and,

WHEREAS, the City desires to pursue improvements necessary to enhance the public’s access to Veterans Parkway and the facilities located on said Parkway; and,

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is wise, expedient, and in the best interests of the citizens of Pell City to enter into a professional services agreement with Wisener, LLC to assist in property acquisition to improve access to Veterans Parkway.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City, Alabama, as follows:

Section 1.  That the City Manager be, and he hereby is, authorized to enter into a Professional Services Agreement with Wisener, LLC in an amount not to exceed $72,000.00 to assist in property acquisition to improve access to Veterans Parkway pending review and final approval by the City Attorney.  
On motion of Councilman Henderson, seconded by Councilman Alverson, the council unanimously approved the following resolution approving a Memorandum of Understanding with St. Clair County for the use of the County’s GIS Systems and Services.

RESOLUTION NO. 2017 - 4836
A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY OF

PELL CITY TO ENTER INTO A MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING WITH ST. CLAIR COUNTY FOR THE USE OF THEIR GIS SYSTEMS AND SERVICES

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City (the “City”) has partnered with St. Clair County (the “County”) for several years in the utilization of their Geographic Information Systems and Services (“GIS System”); and

WHEREAS, the County has proposed to enter into a Memorandum of Understanding in accordance to the terms set forth in the attached Exhibit A; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is wise, expedient, and in the best interests of the citizens of Pell City to enter into an MOU with the County.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City, Alabama, as follows:

Section 1.  That the Mayor be, and he hereby is, authorized to enter into an MOU with St. Clair County pursuant to the terms set forth as Exhibit A and expressly incorporated herein by reference pending final review and approval by the City Attorney. 
On motion of Councilman Jenkins, seconded by Councilman Henderson, the council unanimously approved the following resolution declaring certain items as surplus.

RESOLUTION NO. 2017 - 4837
A RESOLUTION PROVIDING FOR THE SALE OF UNNEEDED PERSONAL PROPERTY

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City, Alabama, has certain items of personal property which are no longer needed for public or municipal purposes; and,

WHEREAS, Section 11-43-56, Ala. Code 1975, authorizes the municipal governing body to dispose of unneeded personal property;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City, Alabama, as follows:

Section 1.  That the following personal property owned by the City of Pell City, Alabama, is not needed for public or municipal purposes:

· 2010 Ford Crown Vic



VIN# 2FABP7BV2AX108473

· Five (5) outdoor park charcoal grills 
· Six (6) plastic coated metal picnic tables with benches
As Section 2.   That the Mayor and the City Manager be, and they hereby are, authorized and directed to dispose of the personal property owned by the City of Pell City, Alabama, described in Section 1, above, by receiving bids for such property.  All such property shall be sold to the highest bidder, provided, however, that the Council shall have the authority to reject all bids when, in its opinion, it deems the bids to be less than adequate consideration for the personal property.
On motion of Councilman Jenkins, seconded by Councilman Alverson, the council unanimously approved to table the consideration of the creation and appointment of members to the Park & Rec Advisory Board.

On motion of Councilman Mitcham, seconded by Councilman Jenkins, the council unanimously approved the following resolution awarding the bid on concession supplies for the Park & Rec Department.

RESOLUTION NO. 2017 - 4838

A RESOLUTION AWARDING THE BID FOR THE CONCESSION SUPPLIES AT THE CITY OF PELL CITY SPORTS COMPLEX

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has taken and received competitive sealed bids for the concession supplies at the Sports Complex, which supplies are more particularly described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “A”; and

WHEREAS, the only bid received by the City was submitted by Gordon Food Service.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that the City awards the bid for the concession supplies at the Sports Complex to Gordon Food Service, as detailed in the bid submittal form, which is attached hereto as Exhibit “B” and expressly incorporated herein by reference.
On motion of Councilman Jenkins, seconded by Councilman Alverson, the council unanimously approved the following resolution awarding the bids received on the F-150, F-250 and F-350 for the Street and Utility Department.
RESOLUTION NO. 2017 – 4839

A RESOLUTION AWARDING THE BID FOR THE

PURCHASE OF CERTAIN STREET AND UTILITY VEHICLES

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has taken and received competitive sealed bids for the purchase of certain vehicles to be used by the Street Department and Utility Department, which equipment is more particularly described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “A”; and

WHEREAS, the lowest bid that met the specifications established by the City for the F-150, F-250 and F-350 was submitted by Town & Country Ford in the total amount of $88,564.00.
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that the City awards the bid for the purchase of the above-described Street Department and Utility Department vehicles to Town & Country Ford in the amount of $88,564.00.

On motion of Councilman Mitcham, seconded by Councilman Henderson, the council unanimously approved the following resolution awarding the bid received on the F-450 for the Utility Department.

RESOLUTION NO. 2017 – 4840

A RESOLUTION AWARDING THE BID FOR THE

PURCHASE OF A CERTAIN UTILITY VEHICLE

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has taken and received competitive sealed bids for the purchase of certain vehicles to be used by the Street Department and Utility Department, which equipment is more particularly described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “A”; and

WHEREAS, the lowest bid that met the specifications established by the City for F-450 was submitted by Sunny King Ford in the total amount of $47,025.80.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that the City awards the bid for the purchase of the above-described Utility Department vehicle to Sunny King Ford in the amount of $47,025.80.

On motion of Councilman Henderson, seconded by Councilman Alverson, the council unanimously approved the following resolution approving the quote received for the financing of the new Police, Fire and Street Department vehicles with BB&T.
RESOLUTION NO. 2017 – 4841

A RESOLUTION APPROVING FINANCING TERMS WITH BRANCH BANKING AND TRUST COMPANY FOR THE PURCHASE OF VARIOUS VEHICLES FOR THE CITY OF PELL CITY

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City(“Governmental Entity”) has previously determined to undertake a project for the purchase of six (6) Police SUV’s, a Pickup Truck and a Pumper Truck (the “Project”), and the officer of the Governmental Entity responsible for the financial affairs of the Governmental Entity (the “Finance Officer”) has now presented a proposal for the financing of such Project.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS:

1. The Governmental Entity hereby determines to finance the Project.  The amount financed shall not exceed $568,000.00, annual interest rate (in the absence of default or change in tax status) shall not exceed 2.05%, and the financing term shall not exceed sixty (60) months from closing.

2. All financing contracts and all related documents for the closing of the financing (the “Financing Documents”) shall be consistent with the foregoing terms. The Mayor, City Manager and Finance Officer of the Governmental Entity are hereby authorized and directed to execute and deliver any Financing Documents, and to take all such further action as they may consider necessary or desirable, to carry out the financing of the Project as contemplated by the proposal and this Resolution. The Financing Documents shall include a Financing Agreement and a Project Fund Agreement as BB&T may request.

3. The Finance Officer is hereby authorized and directed to hold executed copies of the Financing Documents until the conditions for the delivery of the Financing Documents have been completed to such officer’s satisfaction. The Finance Officer is authorized to approve changes to any Financing Documents previously signed by Governmental Entity officers or employees, provided that such changes shall not substantially alter the intent of such documents or certificates from the intent expressed in the forms executed by such officers. The Financing Documents shall be in such final forms as the Finance Officer shall approve, with the Finance Officer’s release of any Financing Document for delivery constituting conclusive evidence of such officer’s final approval of the document’s final form.

4. The Governmental Entity shall not take or omit to take any action the taking or omission of which shall cause its interest payments on this financing to be includable in the gross income for federal income tax purposes of the registered owners of the interest payment obligations under the Financing Documents.  The Governmental Entity hereby designates its obligations to make principal and interest payments under the Financing Documents as “qualified tax-exempt obligations” for the purpose of Internal Revenue Code Section 265(b)(3).

5. The Governmental Entity intends that the adoption of this Resolution will be a declaration of the Governmental Entity’s official intent to reimburse expenditures for the Project that is to be financed from the proceeds of the BB&T financing described above. The Governmental Entity intends that funds that have been advanced, or that may be advanced, from the Governmental Entity’s general fund, or any other Governmental Entity fund related to the Project, for Project costs may be reimbursed from the financing proceeds.

6. The officers of the Governmental Entity and any person or persons designated and authorized by any officer of the Governmental Entity to act in the name and on behalf of the Governmental Entity, or any one or more of them, are authorized to do and perform or cause to be done and performed in the name and on behalf of the Governmental Entity such other acts, to pay or cause to be paid on behalf of the Governmental Entity such related costs and expenses, and to execute and deliver or cause to be executed and delivered in the name and on behalf of the Governmental Entity such other notices, requests, demands, directions, consents, approvals, orders, applications, certificates, agreements, further assurances, or other instruments or communications, under the corporate seal of the Governmental Entity, or otherwise, as they or any of them may deem necessary, advisable, or appropriate in order to (a) complete the plan of financing contemplated by the Financing Documents, (b) carry into effect the intent of the provisions of this Resolution and the Financing Documents, and (c) demonstrate the validity of the Financing Documents, the absence of any pending or threatened litigation with respect to the Financing Documents and the plan of financing contemplated by the Financing Documents, and the exemption of interest on the interest payment obligations under the Financing Documents from federal and State of Alabama income taxation.

7. All prior actions of Governmental Entity officers in furtherance of the purposes of this resolution are hereby ratified, approved and confirmed. All other ordinances or resolutions (or parts thereof) in conflict with this Resolution are hereby repealed, to the extent of the conflict.  This Resolution shall take effect immediately.

On motion of Councilman Jenkins, seconded by Councilman Mitcham, the council unanimously approved the following resolution approving the purchase of the NOAA Weather Radios for residents.

RESOLUTION NO. 2017 – 4842

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE PROPOSAL FROM 

BAKER’S COMMUNICATIONS, INC. FOR THE
 PURCHASE OF WEATHER RADIOS 

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City applied and was awarded a grant through the Coosa Valley RC&D Council; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to purchase Emergency Notification Equipment for the citizens of Pell City; and

WHEREAS, the City has requested and received proposals for the purchase of such equipment at a cost of $24.90 per radio which equipment is more particularly described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “A”; and

WHEREAS, the lowest responsive and responsible proposal that met the specifications established by the City was submitted by Baker’s Communications, Inc.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that the City accepts the proposal from Baker’s Communications, Inc. for the Emergency Notification Equipment at a cost of $24.90 per radio.
On motion of Councilman Alverson, seconded be Councilman Jenkins, the council unanimously tabled RESOLUTION NO. 2017 – 4845 awarding the bid received on the Industrial Access Road Improvements under Project# IAR 058-000-006.

Council President McGowan introduced the following ordinance setting aside funds for capital improvement projects.

ORDINANCE NO. 2017 – 4843

AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING A PERPETUAL CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT FUND FOR THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA, AND DESIGNATING CERTAIN FUNDS FOR 
CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS


WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Pell City recognizes the importance of maintaining quality infrastructure and public improvements in the City; and, 

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is wise, prudent, and in the best interests of the citizens of Pell City to establish a perpetual capital improvement fund and to designate certain funding sources to provide for the purchase of capital equipment, such as vehicles, machinery, and other long-lasting goods that are not consumed in the normal course of business, and the construction, installation, repair, renovation, or maintenance of public buildings, structures, sewers, waterworks, roads, curbs, gutters, side walls, bridges, docks, underpasses, and viaducts, as well as any other improvement to be constructed, installed, repaired, renovated, or maintained on public property and to be paid, in whole or in part, with public funds, together with all professional fees associated with said projects, including, but not limited to, engineering fees, survey expenses, and other associated expenses.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS:

1. There is hereby established the Capital Improvement Fund of the City of Pell City, Alabama.

2. Beginning in Fiscal Year 2017-18, and continuing each fiscal year thereafter, the City shall transfer to the Capital Improvement Fund of the City of Pell City, Alabama, the total of three percent (3%) of the revenue collected and retained by the City from the taxes levied pursuant to Ordinance No. 2001-1585, as amended, and Ordinance No. 2001-1591, as amended, after the deduction of all costs of collection.

3. Beginning in Fiscal Year 2017-18, and continuing each fiscal year thereafter, the City shall transfer to the Capital Improvement Fund of the City of Pell City, Alabama, all revenue collected and retained by the City from the taxes levied pursuant to Ordinance No. 2005-1849, as amended, after the deduction of all costs of collection.

4. The Capital Improvement Fund of the City of Pell City, Alabama, shall be used for the purchase of capital equipment, such as vehicles, machinery, and other long-lasting goods that are no consumed in the normal course of business, and the construction, installation, repair, renovation, or maintenance of public buildings, structures, sewers, waterworks, roads, curbs, gutters, side walls, bridges, docks, underpasses, and viaducts, as well as any other improvement to be constructed, installed, repaired, renovated, or maintained on public property and to be paid, in whole or in part, with public funds, together with all professional fees associated with said projects, including, but not limited to, engineering fees, survey expenses, and other associated expenses.

5. Severability.  If any part, section, or provision of this Ordinance shall hereafter be declared unconstitutional or invalid for any reason, such declaration shall not affect the validity of any other section or provision of this Ordinance, which shall continue in full force and effect notwithstanding such holding.

6. Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances.  Any Ordinance in conflict with this Ordinance shall be and is hereby repealed on the effective date of this Ordinance.

7. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective upon approval and publication as required by law.

Councilman Jenkins moved that all rules and regulations, which unless suspended would prevent the immediate consideration and adoption of said ordinance, be suspended and that unanimous consent to the immediate consideration and adoption of said ordinance be given.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Mitcham.  On roll call vote, the motion was unanimously approved.  Those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved.

Councilman Alverson then moved that said ordinance be now placed upon its final passage and adopted.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Jenkins.  The question being put as to the adoption of said motion and the passage of said ordinance, on roll call vote, the motion was unanimously approved.  Those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved and the ordinance adopted.

Council President McGowan introduced the following ordinance amending the Water Capital Recovery and Sewer Impact Fees.

ORDINANCE NO. 2017 – 4844

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 2008-1967, WHICH AMENDED ORDINANCE NO. 2007-1925, TO AMEND THE IMPACT FEES FOR SEWER SERVICE AND CAPITAL RECOVERY FEES FOR WATER SERVICE IN THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section A:
That the provisions of Ordinance No. 2008-1967, which amended Ordinance No. 2007-1928, are hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION 1. ESTABLISHMENT OF SEWER IMPACT FEES. The owner of any property not categorized in Section 4 below who or which connects said property to the City's sewer system shall pay a nonrefundable impact fee in the amount of $1,800.00 for each unit on said property to be serviced by the City’s sewer system. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said impact fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City’s sewer system. 

SECTION 2. ESTABLISHMENT OF WATER CAPITAL RECOVERY FEES. The owner of any property not categorized in Section 4 below who or which connects said property to the City’s water system shall pay a nonrefundable capital recovery fee in the following amount:

	Size of Line
	Fee

	3/4"
	$1,050.00

	1"
	$1,750.00

	2"
	$5,600.00

	3"
	$11,200.00

	4" and above
	$17,500.00


for each unit on said property to be serviced by the City's water system. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said water capital recovery fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City’s water system.

SECTION 3. DEFINITION OF "UNIT." A unit, for purposes of this Ordinance, is hereby defined as follows: A structure having a roof supported by columns or walls for the shelter, support, or enclosure of persons; and when supported by division walls from the ground up without ingress and egress provided between such divisions by suitable openings, each portion of such building so divided shall be deemed a separate unit. For residential purposes, any portion of a building used as a separate abode for a family shall be considered a "unit."  For commercial and industrial purposes, any portion of a building used as separate quarters for the operation of a separate business shall be considered a "unit." 

SECTION 4. ESTABLISHMENT OF SEWER IMPACT AND WATER CAPITAL RECOVERY FEES FOR HOTELS/MOTELS, APARTMENTS, NURSING HOMES/ASSISTED LIVING FACILITIES, AND HOSPITALS. 

A. HOTELS/MOTELS. 


1. 
SEWER IMPACT FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs a hotel or motel on said property and connects said property to the City's sewer system shall pay a nonrefundable sewer impact fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of rooms in the hotel/motel by 0.46 by the amount set forth in Section 1 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said impact fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's sewer system.



 
2. 
WATER CAPITAL RECOVERY FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs a hotel or motel on said property and connects said property to the City's water system shall pay a nonrefundable capital recovery fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of rooms in the hotel/motel by 0.46 by the amount set forth for a 3/4-inch line in Section 2 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said water capital recovery fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's water system. 


B. 
APARTMENTS. 


1. 
SEWER IMPACT FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs apartments on said property and connects said property to the City's sewer system shall pay a nonrefundable sewer impact fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of apartments by 0.57 by the amount set forth in Section 1 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said impact fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's sewer system. 


2. 
WATER CAPITAL RECOVERY FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs apartments on said property and connects said property to the City's water system shall pay a nonrefundable capital recovery fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of apartments by 0.57 by the amount set forth for a 3/4-inch line in Section 2 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said water capital recovery fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's water system. 


C. 
NURSING HOMES/ASSISTED LIVING FACILITIES. 


1. 
SEWER IMPACT FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs a nursing home or assisted living facility on said property and connects said property to the City's sewer system shall pay a nonrefundable sewer impact fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of beds in the nursing home/assisted living facility by 0.29 by the amount set forth in Section 1 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said impact fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's sewer system. 


2. 
WATER CAPITAL RECOVERY FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs a nursing home or assisted living facility on said property and connects said property to the City's water system shall pay a nonrefundable capital recovery fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of beds in the nursing home/assisted living facility by 0.29 by the amount set forth for a 3/4-inch line in Section 2 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said water capital recovery fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's water system. 


D. 
HOSPITALS. 


1. 
SEWER IMPACT FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs a hospital on said property and connects said property to the City's sewer system shall pay a nonrefundable sewer impact fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of beds in the hospital by 1.02 by the amount set forth in Section 1 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said impact fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's sewer system. 




2. 
WATER CAPITAL RECOVERY FEE. The owner of any property who or which constructs a hospital on said property and connects said property to the City's water system shall pay a nonrefundable capital recovery fee in an amount determined by multiplying the number of beds in the hospital by 1.02 by the amount set forth for a 3/4-inch line in Section 2 above. Said fee is payable at the time a building permit is issued for said property. Said water capital recovery fee is payable in addition to, and not in lieu of, any other fee now existing or hereafter established by the City. The fees generated pursuant to this section shall be used by the City only for capital improvements to the City's water system.

Section B:
Severability.  If any section or provision of this Ordinance shall hereafter be declared invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such declaration shall not affect the validity of any other section or provision of this Ordinance.

Section C:
Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances.  Any Ordinance in conflict with this Ordinance shall be and is hereby repealed on the effective date of this Ordinance.

Section D:
Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective immediately following approval, passage, and publication as required by law.

Councilman Jenkins moved that all rules and regulations, which unless suspended would prevent the immediate consideration and adoption of said ordinance, be suspended and that unanimous consent to the immediate consideration and adoption of said ordinance be given.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Alverson.  On roll call vote, the motion was unanimously approved.  Those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved.

Councilman Henderson then moved that said ordinance be now placed upon its final passage and adopted.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Alverson.  The question being put as to the adoption of said motion and the passage of said ordinance, on roll call vote, the motion was unanimously approved.  Those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved and the ordinance adopted.

Council President McGowan introduced the following ordinance amending water and sewer rates.

ORDINANCE NO. 2017 – 4846

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 2017-4737, FIXING AND PRESCRIBING RATES, CHARGES, TERMS, AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICES TO BE FURNISHED BY THE WATER AND SEWER SYSTEMS OF THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section A:
That the provisions of Section 4, Water and Sewer Rates, and Section 22, City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule, of Ordinance No. 2017-4737 are hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION 4.  WATER AND SEWER RATES.
(a) The rates for water service for residential, commercial, and industrial usage furnished by the City of Pell City shall be as shown on the City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule, which shall be subject to adjustment by ordinance of the City Council of the City of Pell City.

(b) A sewage disposal service charge shall be paid by the owner or owners of each premises which shall dispose of sewage wastes originating from or on such premises by discharge thereof into any sanitary sewer served by the City sewer system.  The sewage disposal charge shall be computed on the basis of the quantity of water used upon the premises so served by the sewer system, as measured by the meter reading of the water system serving such premises, except as provided in subsection (c) below.  The rates for sewer service for residential, commercial, and industrial usage furnished by the City of Pell City shall be as shown on the City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule, which shall be subject to adjustment by ordinance of the City Council of the City of Pell City.

(c) In cases where the character of the sewage from any premises is such that it imposes an unreasonable burden upon the sewer system, the service rendered by the sewer system to such premises may be given a special classification in City’s schedule of sewer service charges and an additional charge may be made for such special classification of service, or the City may require such sewage to be treated in such manner as shall be specified by the City before it is discharged into the sewer system.

(d) Automatic Increase – Effective January 1, 2018, and each year thereafter, the rates for water and sewer service as shown on the City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule shall automatically increase by three (3%) percent, unless action is taken by the City Council.

(e) Low-Income Senior Citizen Discount.

(1) Reduced Water and Sewer Rates.  The City of Pell City hereby authorizes a reduced monthly rate for residential low-income senior citizen customers of the City’s water and sewer utilities.  The reduced rate shall be known as the “Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate” as shown on the City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule, which shall be subject to adjustment by ordinance of the City Council of the City of Pell City.

(2) Eligibility. 

(a) The Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate shall be available to any household that meets the following criteria:

i. The residence seeking to receive the Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate must be occupied by one (1) or more senior citizens, aged sixty-five (65) years or older at the time of application, who is the named customer and responsible for the City’s water or sewer service provided at the residence.

ii. The total gross household income for all household occupants, regardless of age, from all sources (such as Social Security, Disability payments, Veteran’s benefits, pensions, rents, annuities, retirement account withdrawals, etc.) must not exceed $14,400 per year.

(b) The Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate shall be available for residential customers only; non-residential customers shall be ineligible to receive such rate.

(3) Application Procedures.

i. The City Manager, or his or her designee, shall create an application form and a renewal form to comply with the provisions of this Ordinance.  Applications shall be available at the City Hall of the City of Pell City or mailed to a customer of the City, upon request.

ii. Persons wishing to apply for the Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate shall file a written application with the City on the form approved by the City.  This form shall include a statement in which the applicant attests under oath that the information provided by the applicant is true and correct to the best of the applicant’s knowledge.

iii. The applicant must provide proof of age demonstrating that the he or she is 65 years or older.  The applicant shall establish this requirement by providing a birth certificate, driver’s license or other valid Alabama identification, or other reliable official documentation of age.

iv. The applicant must provide proof of household income demonstrating that the total gross household income for all household occupants, regardless of age, from all sources does not exceed $14,400 per year.  The applicant shall establish this requirement by providing a copy of the most recent Federal Income Tax returns of all occupants residing in the household or, in the absence of a Federal Income Tax return, other reliable official documentation of annual household income.

v. The City may require any other information from the applicant reasonably necessary to determine the applicant’s eligibility.

(4) Annual Application Required.

i. Applications for the Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate shall be completed annually.

ii. A notice of renewal of application shall be mailed annually by the City to the then existing water or sewer customers receiving the Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate.  The completed renewal application form shall be returned to the City within 45 days, or the Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate shall be removed from the customer’s account.

iii. For new applicants, the Low-Income Senior Citizen Rate shall commence on the next subsequent billing date following approval of the applicant’s application.  

(5) Violation—Penalties.

The City hall have the authority to take all measures, criminal and/or civil, allowed by law to seek reimbursement for any reduction in utility rates achieved based on intentional misrepresentation, fraud, or deceit, and to seek any and all other penalties available under the law.

SECTION 22. CITY OF PELL CITY WATER AND SEWER RATE AND FEE SCHEDULE.

The City hereby adopts the City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule, attached hereto as Exhibit A and expressly incorporated herein by reference.  The City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule shall be subject to adjustment by ordinance of the City Council of the City of Pell City.

Section B:
Severability.  If any section or provision of this Ordinance shall hereafter be declared invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such declaration shall not affect the validity of any other section or provision of this Ordinance.

Section C:
Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances.  Any Ordinance, or portion thereof, in conflict with this Ordinance shall be and is hereby repealed on the effective date of this Ordinance.

Section D:
Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon its adoption and publication as required by law.
	 City of Pell City Water and Sewer Rate and Fee Schedule 

	-adopted by the City of Pell City on _________ __, 2017

	Water and Sewer Rates

	Inside City Limit Rates

	Sewer**pls see LC & RCF below**
	Customer Type
	Water **pls see LC & RCF below**

	Cost per 1,000 gallons above 2,000 gallons
	Monthly Minimum Chargefirst 2,000 gallons
	Cost per 1,000 gallons above 2,000 gallons
	Monthly Minimum Chargefirst 2,000 gallons

	Residential
	25.30
	4.65
	25.30
	4.65

	20% of regular per thousand gallon rate
	20% of regular per thousand gallon rate

	Senior Citizen
	10.69
	10.69

	Commercial 
	4.65
	4.65
	63.82
	63.82

	*under 2,000 gal per month
	31.91*
	31.91*

	Industrial
	4.65
	88.23
	88.23
	4.65

	**LC - a penalty of 10% will be added to all bills if not paid within 15 days following the date of the bill, provided however that the total minimum penalty shall be no less than $5.00 per service provided.** 

	**RCF - The City shall have the right to assess and add to the customer’s bill a service charge in the amount of $30.00 for any check presented to the City in payment of said customer’s bill 

	and which check is subsequently returned unpaid to the City by the issuing bank for any reason. **

	Outside City Limit Rates

	Customer Type
	Water
	Sewer

	Monthly Minimum Chargefirst 2,000 gallons
	Cost per 1,000 gallons above 2,000 gallons
	Monthly Minimum Chargefirst 2,000 gallons
	Cost per 1,000 gallons above 2,000 gallons

	Residential
	39.80
	6.66
	36.18
	6.66

	20% of regular per thousand gallon rate
	20% of regular per thousand gallon rate

	Senior Citizen
	15.30
	15.30

	Commercial 
	91.27
	6.66
	91.27
	6.66

	*under 2,000 gal per month
	45.63
	45.63

	Industrial
	126.17
	6.66
	126.17
	6.66

	**LC - a penalty of 10% will be added to all bills if not paid within 15 days following the date of the bill, provided however that the total minimum penalty shall be no less than $5.00 per service provided.** 

	**RCF - The City shall have the right to assess and add to the customer’s bill a service charge in the amount of $30.00 for any check presented to the City in payment of said customer’s bill 

	and which check is subsequently returned unpaid to the City by the issuing bank for any reason. **

	Water Meter Deposits and Service Fees

	Customer Type
	Deposit Amount
	Reconnection Fee (1st)
	Reconnection (2nd+)
	Service Charge **pls see SC below** 

	Residential
	75.00
	50.00
	75.00
	30.00

	50.00
	30.00

	Residential - Rental or Lease
	75.00
	100.00

	Commercial
	150.00
	100.00
	150.00
	30.00

	Industrial
	150.00
	100.00
	150.00
	30.00

	Hydrant Meter 
	800.00
	0.00
	0.00
	0.00

	**SC - in the event customer reports leaks or problems concerning water and/or sewer service, and such problems are determined to be the responsibility of the customer, 

	the City shall have the right to assess and add to the customer's bill a fee in the amount of $30.00 for the cost of going to the customer's premises**

	Water Service and Sewer Lateral Inspection Costs

	*The following fees apply only to a single water or sewer connection on an existing main for a new customer. These fees do not apply when only a meter set or connection to a sewer service stub-out is needed. 

	Description
	Inspection Fee

	180.00
	Water
	3/4”

	220.00
	1”

	375.00
	2”

	550.00
	4”

	800.00
	≥6”

	400.00
	Sewer
	Residential

	550.00
	Commercial

	Industrial
	750.00

	3/4" Water Service Line Installation 

	*If requested by a potential customer and as approved by the City on a case by case basis, the City, as a service to a potential customer, will provide all material and labor for the installation of a 3/4" water service line complete (saddle, tap, service line, valves, meter, meter box, backflow) from the main to the property line at the below rate. 

	3/4" Water Service Line
	Fee

	Short side service
	920.00

	Long side service
	1600.00


Councilman Alverson moved that all rules and regulations, which unless suspended would prevent the immediate consideration and adoption of said ordinance, be suspended and that unanimous consent to the immediate consideration and adoption of said ordinance be given.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Henderson.  On roll call vote, the motion was unanimously approved.  Those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved.

Councilman Henderson then moved that said ordinance be now placed upon its final passage and adopted.  The motion was seconded by Councilman Alverson.  The question being put as to the adoption of said motion and the passage of said ordinance, on roll call vote, the motion was unanimously approved.  Those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmen Jenkins, Henderson, Mitcham and Alverson.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved and the ordinance adopted.

On motion of Councilman Alverson, seconded by Councilman Mitcham, the council adjourned subject to the call of the Council President.
______________________________

James McGowan - Council President
ATTEST:
______________________________

Penny Isbell - City Clerk
City of Pell City
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