STATE OF ALABAMA

ST. CLAIR COUNTY

The City Council of the City of Pell City met in a work session at the City Hall at 4:30 p.m., on Monday July 25, 2016.  Present were Council President James McGowan, Councilmembers Jay Jenkins, Dot Wood, Sharon Thomas and Terry Templin.  Council President McGowan opened the meeting for discussion.

The invocation was led by Mayor Joe Funderburg.

The pledge to the American Flag was led by Councilmember Terry Templin.

The City Clerk had roll call for attendance.

A discussion was held on the payment of bills on file.  Councilmember Thomas stated that she had discussed the power bill for the Municipal Complex with City Manager Muenger.  There was an issue with the meter at the building and Alabama Power will be sending a corrected bill which will be a lot less than what was previously billed.  Ms. Thomas stated that everything else was fine.    

City Manager Muenger presented four requisitions over the amount of $5,000.00.

· Brenntag Mid-South:  $7,176.00:  Alum refill for the Wastewater Treatment Plant.

· W.W. Williams Southeast, Inc.:  Combination of two invoices totaling $11,200.00 for the annual mechanical inspection and service on fire engines.

· McGriff Tire:  $6,710.00 for different tires and different departments.

· Emergency Equipment Professionals:  $4,823.84 for the emergency repair of a fire engine fuel pump.  Please note that the initial purchase order was in the amount of $5,500.00 due to the emergency situation and uncertainty regarding final cost.

There were no comments on the minutes of the regular council meeting held on July 11th, 2016.

A discussion was held on Resolution Nos. 2016 - 4631 and 2016 - 4633 regarding condemnation of properties located at 255 Oak Leaf Circle and 3120 7th Avenue North property which were tabled from the July 11, 2016 Council meeting.  City Manager Muenger stated the discussion covers both Resolutions.  The current owner and prospective owner of 255 Oak Leaf Circle continue to make progress on the property and provided a timeline for transferring the property.  City Manager Muenger asked that Resolution No. 2016 – 4631 continue to be tabled over and no action taken.  The owner of 3120 7th Avenue North had provided a contract and sufficient plans to begin work at this address.  Building Inspector Larry Riggins has approved the plans from the contractor, and with the Council’s approval the owner will be ready to start working on repairing the home.

Lisa Gaither with the Chamber of Commerce addressed Council to discuss the Chamber’s annual Blues & BBQ event that is planned and they were requesting permission for assistance with Safety, Parks and Recreation assistance, and permission to host the event in similar fashion as last year.  Lisa had spoken with the ABC Licensing Board to sell alcohol in a VIP section of the event.  Caribe Club & Marina will be providing the service and product again this year.  Ms. Gaither explained it will be a BBQ cook-off as it was done in 2015.  Councilmember Jenkins confirmed the alcoholic beverages being sold are done in a specific area of the event.  The date of the event is September 12, 2016, beginning at 12:00 p.m. and concluding at 5:00 p.m.  They are in talks with USA Communications regarding streaming service to the park, and visitors will be able to watch the opening Alabama and Auburn games.  

Beth Hoyle Waggoner spoke with Council pertaining to an event she would like to hold this year called Avondale Mills Day. The event is planned for October 1, 2016, and it is to celebrate Pell City and the Culture of the City.  There will be a 5K Run, Showcase of Local Vendors, Contest, Activities, and Congregational singing.  Mrs. Waggoner requested a contribution of $2,000.00 to be made to The Heart of Pell City to assist with deposits for advertising, entertainment, equipment, traffic control and first responders for the event, and they are working with a total budget of $4,000.00.  She also requested the City to have the sidewalks pressure washed before September, and provide assistance with pre and post event cleanup.  Councilmember Jenkins asked how long she needed traffic to be blocked downtown.  She had met with Chief Turley and discussed only closing a couple of roads and leaving Cogswell Avenue open.  Mayor Funderburg and Councilmembers felt this is a good idea and think the City should be more involved with the cleanup of the City and their appreciation of their groups.
City Manager Muenger described the changes to the job descriptions for the current position available in the Finance Department as the Accounts Payable Clerk.  Finance Director Teri St. James requested the changes approved as soon as possible so they can get the job posted and someone hired.  Councilmembers agreed on the changes.

City Manager Muenger introduced a resolution that ALDOT requested the Council approve for the 19th Street Pedestrian Sidewalk improvement.  Mr. Muenger stated the City received the initial approval for the project with ALDOT in 2008 being very similar to the one provided to Council.  In 2013 the City approved an addition to the initial agreement with the changes and with ALDOT alignments for the regions.  It’s been quite a while since the original agreement had been adopted, and some of the funding amounts had changed.  There was Federal funding in the amount of $282,000.00 with a required local contribution of $70,000.00.  That amount is in the City’s current budget.   ALDOT requested that the City adopt it by Resolution and return the Resolution to them.  The current plan should be completed by August 2016.  At that time the City can proceed to bid for the project.
Bids were presented for the 2016 Fall Sports Uniforms.  Assistant Athletic Director Elliott Jacobik stated he solicited seven bids for the purchase of the Uniforms and received four.  Out of the four bids, one was able to provide a better price for the majority of the uniforms, with B & S Sporting Goods having the best price.  Mr. Jacobik recommended that Council accept the bid from B & S Sporting Goods for the purchase of fall uniforms.  The number of the sports players is around 120, with every sport being offered during the fall season, with soccer and baseball having the largest number of players.  Bids were received as follows:

	FALL SPORTS UNIFORMS BID TABULATIONS

	July 20, 2016 - 10:30 A.M.

	
	
	
	
	

	
	 B & S 
	 BSN SPORTS 
	 GEARED UP 
	 RIDDELL 

	Baseball
	
	
	   
	   

	Jerseys-Adult
	 $        25.50 
	 $        18.50 
	 $        21.50 
	 NO BID 

	Jerseys-Youth
	 $        24.50 
	 $        17.50 
	 $        20.50 
	 NO BID 

	Hats
	 $        11.75 
	 $        12.50 
	 $        10.50 
	 $       14.78 

	Socks
	 $          5.50 
	 $          6.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         5.25 

	Soccer
	
	
	
	   

	Jerseys-Girls & Boys Travel-Adult
	 $        24.99 
	 $        21.00 
	 $        26.50 
	 NO BID 

	Jerseys-Girls & Boys Travel-Youth
	 $        24.79 
	 $        20.00 
	 $        25.50 
	 NO BID 

	Shorts - Girls & Boys Travel Adult
	 $        11.50 
	 $        15.00 
	 $        15.00 
	 NO BID 

	Shorts - Girls & Boys Travel Youth
	 $        11.25 
	 $        14.00 
	 $        14.00 
	 NO BID 

	Socks - Travel Adult
	 $          3.75 
	 $          3.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         6.79 

	Socks - Travel Youth
	 $          3.75 
	 $          3.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         6.79 

	Socks - Travel Junior
	 $          3.75 
	 $          3.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         6.79 

	Jerseys - In House Adult
	 $        17.35 
	 $        20.00 
	 $        19.00 
	 NO BID 

	Jerseys - In HouseYouth
	 $        16.95 
	 $        19.00 
	 $        17.00 
	 NO BID 

	Shorts - In House Adult
	 $          9.85 
	 $        12.00 
	 $        12.00 
	 NO BID 

	Shorts - In HouseYouth
	 $          8.99 
	 $        11.00 
	 $        11.00 
	 NO BID 

	Socks - In House Adult
	 $          3.75 
	 $          3.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         6.79 

	Socks - In House Youth
	 $          3.75 
	 $          3.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         6.79 

	Socks - In House Junior
	 $          3.75 
	 $          3.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         6.79 

	Softball
	
	
	   
	   

	Jerseys - Adult
	 $        19.75 
	 $        23.00 
	 $        18.00 
	 $       20.12 

	Jerseys - Youth
	 $        18.95 
	 $        22.00 
	 $        17.00 
	 $       18.39 

	Pants - Adult
	 $        15.15 
	 $        21.00 
	 $        18.00 
	 $       19.46 

	Pants - Youth
	 $        14.75 
	 $        20.00 
	 $        17.00 
	 $       18.13 

	Socks - Junior
	 $          5.50 
	 $          6.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         2.49 

	Socks - Youth
	 $          5.50 
	 $          6.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         2.49 

	Socks - Adult
	 $          5.50 
	 $          6.00 
	 $          5.00 
	 $         2.49 

	Football
	
	
	   
	   

	Jerseys - Adult
	 $        24.75 
	 $        27.00 
	 $        26.00 
	 $       25.02 

	Jerseys - Youth
	 $        23.88 
	 $        26.00 
	 $        25.50 
	 $       23.69 

	Pants - Adult
	 $        25.85 
	 N/A 
	 $        25.00 
	 $       21.00 

	Pants - Youth
	 $        24.95 
	 $        27.00 
	 $        25.00 
	$        15.79

	Basketball
	
	
	   
	   

	Jerseys - Adult
	 $        16.99 
	 $        21.00 
	 $        18.00 
	 $       26.45 

	Jerseys - Youth
	 $        16.55 
	 $        20.00 
	 $        17.00 
	 $       25.16 

	Shorts - Adult
	 $        14.10 
	 $        14.00 
	 $        14.00 
	 $       19.00 

	Shorts - Youth
	 $        13.50 
	 $        13.00 
	 $        13.00 
	 $       17.71 

	Cheerleading
	
	
	   
	   

	Top - Adult
	 $        37.95 
	 $        55.00 
	 $        36.00 
	 NO BID 

	Top - Youth
	 $        37.95 
	 $        57.00 
	 $        36.00 
	 NO BID 

	Skirt - Adult
	 $        25.75 
	 $        17.00 
	 $        30.00 
	 NO BID 

	Skirt - Youth
	 $        25.75 
	 $        18.00 
	 $        30.00 
	 NO BID 

	Briefs - Adult
	 $          6.65 
	 $          8.00 
	 $          8.00 
	 NO BID 

	Briefs - Youth
	 $          6.65 
	 $          8.00 
	 $          8.00 
	 NO BID 

	Poms
	 $10.25 each 
	 $        16.00 
	 $        12.00 
	 NO BID 


City Manager Muenger discussed with Council about the opening of sealed bids for demolition of condemned structures.  Three bids were received.  Two of the properties were removed from the demolition list, 255 Oak Leaf Circle and 3120 7th Street North, because of the qualifying terms of the plans submitted and being worked on.  All three bids came in above the desirable level, with the lowest bid being $27,125.00, for the demolition of five houses.  The cost of the removal is quite high with the contractor being responsible for carrying the debris to the landfill.  City Manager Muenger asked Council to reject all of the bids, and asked all three contractors to submit a revised proposal.  Mr. Muenger spoke with each of the contractors via email and discussed bidding on demolition of the properties only.  The contactors would be paying more than double the amount at the landfill than what the City is paying at $22.50 per ton.  When requesting the revised proposals the City offered to bear the responsibility of hauling to the landfill, so the City can use their tonnage rate.  The City received a revised bid from A & A Debris Removal in the amount of $12,000.00, with the City hauling the debris to the landfill.  City Attorney Erskine Funderburg stated under the Ordinance that the City exercised the right of condemnation under the property owner having the right to file an appeal within a certain amount of time.  One of the property owners has exercised his right of appeal, and filing in the Circuit Court Monday, July 25, 2016 and a lawsuit of appeal which will stay all actions that are related to that property.  He also filed a bond that was set by the Circuit Clerk as well, and the City will file an answer and let it move through the courts.  That will provide the opportunity for the owner to begin making repairs to the property.  Mr. Funderburg feels it will happen very quickly, and the City has thirty days to respond to his appeal.  However, the City will answer this week.  City Manager Muenger stated there have not been any improvements made to the property that has been approved by the Council.  Bids received were as follows:
	CONDEMNATION DEMOLITION BIDS


	JULY 20, 2016 - 10:00 A.M.


	
			A & A DEBRIS REMOVAL

	GRAHAM & SONS CONST

	THOMAS LAND CLEARING


					
	Property #1

		 NO BID 

	 $                                 6,495.00 

	 $                                 7,150.00 


	255 Oak Leaf Circle

				
					
	Property #2

		 $                                 9,468.00 

	 $                              12,350.00 

	 $                                 9,800.00 


	400 29th Street North

				
					
	Property #4

		 $                                 7,608.00 

	 $                              11,925.00 

	 $                                 8,100.00 


	3120 7th Street North

				
					
	Property #6

		 $                                 9,500.00 

	 $                              12,500.00 

	 $                                 8,450.00 


	1905 2nd Avenue North

			
					
	Property #7

		 $                                 9,500.00 

	 $                              11,800.00 

	 $                                 8,875.00 


	2600 Starnes Drive

				
					
			 $                              36,076.00 

	 $                              55,070.00 

	 $                              42,375.00 


			 $                                                     

	 $                              (6,495.00)

	 $                              (7,150.00)


			 $                               (7,608.00)

	 $                           (11,925.00)

	 $                              (8,100.00)


			 $                              28,468.00 

	 $                              36,650.00 

	 $                              27,125.00 



	


City Clerk Penny Isbell presented a Resolution approving the Election Officers (Poll Workers) for the August 23, 2016 election.   A Resolution was also presented for the compensation for the Election Officers (Poll Workers) at the Rate of $125.00 for the Chief Inspector and Chief Clerk and $100.00 for each of the Election Officers (Poll Workers).
A resolution was presented to certify that James McGowan qualified for the Office of City Council – District 2 for the term commencing on the first Monday of November 2016 with no opposition.  

A resolution was presented to certify that Joe C. Sawyer, III qualified for the Office of Pell City Board of Education – District 1, for the term commencing on the first Monday of November 2016 with no opposition.

A resolution was presented to certify that Cecil L. Fomby qualified for the Office of Pell City Board of Education – District 2 for the term commencing on the first Monday of November 2016 with no opposition.

A resolution was presented to certify that Laurie Mize Henderson qualified for the Office of Pell City Board of Education – District 3 for the term commencing on the first Monday of November 2016 with no opposition.

A resolution was presented to certify that Tammie Williams qualified for the Office of Pell City Board of Education – District 4 for the term commencing on the first Monday of November 2016 with no opposition.
City Manager Muenger thanked the Fire Department, Police Department as well as the Parks and Recreation Department for setting up for the Rodeo, as well as taking down and clearing up the Rodeo site.  He also mentioned during the previous Council Meeting he was asked to begin preparing a policy with regards to Appropriations, and Mr. Rea is now reviewing that.  He will email Council a copy by mid-week.  Also, he discussed having an Executive Session before the Council meeting, with approval of Council.

Mr. Jenkins mentioned the City Hall of Eden currently has a blue tarp on the roof since a storm damaged the roof.  He has been asked on several occasions when the roof will be repaired.  He talked with the City Manager and discussed having it fixed.   City Manager Muenger requested some advice and what the investment might be for the repairs of the building.

Mayor Funderburg stated he had been approached by several people about the decision of Council supposedly denying to aid with donations to the St. Clair County Bar Association being responsible for Foster Children needing suitcases.  Mayor Funderburg wanted to clarify that the Council did not deny any financial assistance to them.  Some have made accusations that the Council voted no, and that was the end of the discussion.  The Council tabled the request and made suggestions for the Bar Association to go to different organizations, and then come back to the Council for assistance.  Councilmember Templin asked of the location to drop off the suitcases, because he had purchased one, and wanted to deliver it for the cause.
There being no further discussions, Council President McGowan adjourned the meeting.  
Council President McGowan stated that the council needed to go into Executive Session before the regular council meeting started.  The City Clerk had roll call for attendance.  Present were Council President James McGowan, Councilmembers Jay Jenkins, Dot Wood, Sharon Thomas and Terry Templin.  City Attorney Erskine Funderburg certified that the purpose of the Executive Session was to discuss a pending legal matter.  At 5:30 p.m., Councilmember Jenkins made a motion to enter into Executive Session for approximately 15 - 20 minutes.  The motion was seconded by Councilmember Wood and unanimously approved by the council.  On roll call, those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmembers Jenkins, Wood, Thomas and Templin.  Nays:  None.  At 5:51 p.m., Councilmember Jenkins made a motion to enter into regular session.  The motion was seconded by Councilmember Templin and unanimously approved by the council.  No action was taken.  Councilmember Templin made a motion to adjourn the meeting.  The motion was seconded by Councilmember Jenkins and unanimously approved by the council.
The City Council of the City of Pell City met in a regular council meeting at the City Hall at 6:00 p.m. on Monday, July 25, 2016.  Present were Council President James McGowan, Councilmembers Jay Jenkins, Dot Wood, Sharon Thomas and Terry Templin.  Those present constituting the entirety of the council, the following business was transacted:

The City Clerk had roll call for attendance.

On motion of Councilmember Jenkins, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved to Suspend the Rules in order to amend the agenda.  On roll call, those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmembers Jenkins, Wood, Thomas and Templin.  Nays:  None.  Council President McGowan declared the motion approved.

On motion of Councilmember Jenkins, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved to add the following item to the agenda.  

· Consider a revision to the Accounts Payable Job Description.

On motion of Councilmember Thomas, seconded by Councilmember Templin, the council unanimously approved the payment of bills on file.

On motion of Councilmember Jenkins, seconded by Councilmember Wood, the council unanimously approved requisitions over $5,000.00 on file.

On motion of Councilmember Templin, seconded by Councilmember Jenkins, the council unanimously approved the minutes of the regular council meeting held on July 11, 2016.

Tabled from the July 11th council meeting was the consideration of RESOLUTION NO. 2016 - 4631 regarding the condemnation of property located at 255 Oak Leaf Circle.  On motion of Councilmember Jenkins, seconded by Councilmember Wood, the council unanimously approved to table this item until the next council meeting.
Tabled from the July 11th council meeting was the consideration of RESOLUTION NO. 2016 - 4633 regarding the condemnation of property located at 3120 7th Avenue North.  Since Mr. Smith presented all documentation needed to approve his plan of work, no action was needed on the resolution.  On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Jenkins, the council unanimously approved Mr. Smith’s plan of work for the repairs to 3120 7th Avenue North.
On motion of Councilmember Templin, seconded by Councilmember Jenkins, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4644
A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA TO ENTER INTO AN AGREEMENT WITH THE 
STATE OF ALABAMA FOR THE PRELIMINARY ENGINEERING FOR THE PEDESTRIAN IMPROVEMENTS SIDEWALK 
PROJECT HPP-A145(900)

BE IT RESOLVED, by the City of Pell City, Alabama as follows:

1. That the City enters into an Agreement with the State of Alabama, acting by and through the Alabama Department of Transportation for:

Project HPP-A145(900), Project Reference Number 100047636, a preliminary engineering project for pedestrian improvements that entail sidewalks in various locations within Pell City, Alabama; which Agreement is before this Council;

2. That the Agreement be executed in the name of the City, by its Mayor, for and in its behalf and that it be attested by the City Clerk and the seal of the City affixed thereto;

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that upon the completion of the execution of the Agreement by all parties, that a copy of such Agreement be kept on file by the City Clerk.
On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Templin, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:  
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4645
A RESOLUTION AWARDING THE BID FOR THE PURCHASE OF CERTAIN UNIFORMS FOR THE YOUTH SPORTS LEAGUES ADMINISTERED BY THE CITY

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has taken and received competitive sealed bids for the purchase of certain uniforms to be used in the fall youth sports leagues administered by the Pell City Parks & Recreation Department, which equipment is more particularly described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “A”; and

WHEREAS, the lowest bid that met the specifications established by the City was submitted by B & S Sporting Goods, LLC in the amounts detailed in the attached bid tabulation sheet, which is attached hereto as Exhibit “B” and expressly incorporated herein by reference.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that the City awards the bid for the purchase of the above-described uniforms to be used in the City’s fall youth sports leagues to B & S Sporting Goods, LLC in the amounts detailed in the attached bid tabulation sheet, which is attached hereto as Exhibit “B” and expressly incorporated herein by reference.

On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Templin, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4646
A RESOLUTION AWARDING THE BID FOR DEMOLITION OF CERTAIN NUISANCE PROPERTY AS DECLARED BY COUNCIL

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has taken and received competitive sealed bids for the demolition of properties declared nuisance in compliance with Ordinance No. 2015 - 4496, more particularly described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “A”; and,

WHEREAS, all bids received exceeded the estimated budget; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to reject all bids as presented and accept a revised proposal from A & A Debris Removal and Demo in the amount of $12,000.00 as described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “B”; and

WHEREAS, this resolution will serve as a binding contract with A & A Debris Removal and Demo for the purpose of demolishing the above properties as referenced in Exhibit “B” and declared nuisance in compliance with Ordinance No. 2015 – 4496.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that the City reject all bids received for the demolition of the above referenced properties and award the contract to A & A Debris Removal and Demo in the amount of $12,000.00 as described in the revised proposal.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Mayor and/or City Manager be, and they hereby are, authorized to execute such documents as are necessary to begin the services approved herein.

On motion of Councilmember Thomas, seconded by Councilmember Jenkins, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4647
A RESOLUTION APPOINTING ELECTION OFFICERS FOR 

THE CITY OF PELL CITY’S MUNICIPAL ELECTION 

TO BE HELD AUGUST 23, 2016


WHEREAS, a regular municipal election has been called to be held on the 23rd day of August, 2016, and a runoff election to be held, if necessary, on the 4th day of October, 2016, and


WHEREAS, Section 11-46-24 and Section 11-46-27 of the Alabama Code of 1975, and regulations adopted pursuant thereto provide, in part, that the municipal governing body, not less than 15 days before the holding of any municipal election, appoint from the municipality, officers to hold the election as follows:  where electronic ballot counters are used, at least one inspector and three clerks,


NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of Pell City, Alabama, that the election officers for said election shall be as follows:
Chief Inspector:


Bernard White


Chief Clerk:


Betty Turner

Voting District No. 1



Inspector:


Sara McKnight


Clerks:



Delores Frazier





Katie Lane

Wes Partain
Voting District No. 2
Inspector:


Jennifer Gover

Clerks:



Kenneth Gover





Evelyn Chaney





Jerry Chaney

Voting District No. 3


Inspector:


Patsy Ford

Clerks:



Blair Goodgame

Alice Sullivan





Lorenzo “Ren” Wheeler

Voting District No. 4
Inspector:


Betty Gardner

Clerks:



Mary Nell Lauderdale





J. W. Garrett





Dora Jeanette Smith

Voting District No. 5

Inspector:


Julia Burns

Clerks:



Faye Bivens


 


Peggie Frazier





Joyce Smith

Absentee Clerks:

Bill Butterworth





Ofes Forman
On motion of Councilmember Jenkins, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4648

A RESOLUTION SETTING THE COMPENSATION FOR 

ELECTION OFFICIALS OF THE CITY OF PELL CITY’S 

2016 MUNICIPAL ELECTION

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PELL CITY, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1: That the Alabama Code of 1975 § 11-46-27 addresses the compensation for Election Officials for the Municipal Election to be held on August 23, 2016 and Runoff Election on October 4, 2016 if necessary. Compensation is set as follows:



Chief Inspector

$125.00


Chief Clerk

$125.00


Inspectors

$100.00


Clerks


$100.00

Section 2: This resolution shall become effective on the 25th day of July 2016, and shall continue in force and effect until rescinded by action of the council.

On motion of Councilmember Templin, seconded by Councilmember Jenkins, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4649

A RESOLUTION DECLARING JAMES McGOWAN 

DULY ELECTED TO THE OFFICE OF 

CITY COUNCIL – DISTRICT 2 

FOR THE TERM OF OFFICE COMMENCING ON THE FIRST MONDAY OF NOVEMBER 2016

WHEREAS. Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provide for and regular general and special elections in cities and towns of this state, except those cities and towns which have a commission form of government; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-43 of the Alabama Code of 1975 prohibits write-in candidates in elections held under Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-26 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provides that if only one person has filed a statement of candidacy or has been nominated for an office for an election to be held pursuant to Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, at the time the deadline for qualification has passed, then such person shall, for all purposes, be deemed elected to such office, and the mayor or other chief executive officer shall not cause the name of such person or the office for which his candidacy was declared to be printed on the ballot, but he shall immediately file a written statement with the governing body of the municipality attested by the clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy or was nominated for the office preceding the deadline set for an election of municipal officers of the municipality and setting forth the name of such person; and

WHEREAS, said Section 11-46-20, as amended, provides that the governing body of the municipality, after receiving such statement, shall adopt a resolution declaring the person named in the statement duly elected to the office described in the statement, and shall issue a Certificate of Election to such person; and

WHEREAS, the Mayor of the City of Pell City has filed a written statement with the governing body of the municipality, attested by the Clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy for the office of City Council – District 2 prior to the deadline and that the name of that person who filed such statement was James McGowan.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that James McGowan be and he is hereby declared duly elected to the office of City Council – District 2 in the City of Pell City for the term of office commencing on the first Monday of November, 2016; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor of the City of Pell City be and he hereby is directed to issue a certificate of election to James McGowan for the office of City Council – District 2 for such term pursuant to the provisions of Section 11-46-25, as amended.

On motion of Councilmember Templin, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4650

A RESOLUTION DECLARING JOE C. SAWYER III 

DULY ELECTED TO THE OFFICE OF 

PELL CITY BOARD OF EDUCATION – DISTRICT 1 

FOR THE TERM OF OFFICE COMMENCING ON THE FIRST MONDAY OF NOVEMBER 2016

WHEREAS. Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provide for and regular general and special elections in cities and towns of this state, except those cities and towns which have a commission form of government; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-43 of the Alabama Code of 1975 prohibits write-in candidates in elections held under Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-26 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provides that if only one person has filed a statement of candidacy or has been nominated for an office for an election to be held pursuant to Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, at the time the deadline for qualification has passed, then such person shall, for all purposes, be deemed elected to such office, and the mayor or other chief executive officer shall not cause the name of such person or the office for which his candidacy was declared to be printed on the ballot, but he shall immediately file a written statement with the governing body of the municipality attested by the clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy or was nominated for the office preceding the deadline set for an election of municipal officers of the municipality and setting forth the name of such person; and

WHEREAS, said Section 11-46-20, as amended, provides that the governing body of the municipality, after receiving such statement, shall adopt a resolution declaring the person named in the statement duly elected to the office described in the statement, and shall issue a Certificate of Election to such person; and

WHEREAS, the Mayor of the City of Pell City has filed a written statement with the governing body of the municipality, attested by the Clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 1 prior to the deadline and that the name of that person who filed such statement was Joe C. Sawyer III.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that Joe C. Sawyer, III be and he is hereby declared duly elected to the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 1 in the City of Pell City for the term of office commencing on the first Monday of November, 2016; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor of the City of Pell City be and he hereby is directed to issue a certificate of election to Joe C. Sawyer, III for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 1 for such term pursuant to the provisions of Section 11-46-25, as amended.

On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4651

A RESOLUTION DECLARING CECIL L. FOMBY 

DULY ELECTED TO THE OFFICE OF 

PELL CITY BOARD OF EDUCATION – DISTRICT 2 

FOR THE TERM OF OFFICE COMMENCING ON THE FIRST MONDAY OF NOVEMBER 2016

WHEREAS. Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provide for and regular general and special elections in cities and towns of this state, except those cities and towns which have a commission form of government; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-43 of the Alabama Code of 1975 prohibits write-in candidates in elections held under Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-26 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provides that if only one person has filed a statement of candidacy or has been nominated for an office for an election to be held pursuant to Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, at the time the deadline for qualification has passed, then such person shall, for all purposes, be deemed elected to such office, and the mayor or other chief executive officer shall not cause the name of such person or the office for which his candidacy was declared to be printed on the ballot, but he shall immediately file a written statement with the governing body of the municipality attested by the clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy or was nominated for the office preceding the deadline set for an election of municipal officers of the municipality and setting forth the name of such person; and

WHEREAS, said Section 11-46-20, as amended, provides that the governing body of the municipality, after receiving such statement, shall adopt a resolution declaring the person named in the statement duly elected to the office described in the statement, and shall issue a Certificate of Election to such person; and

WHEREAS, the Mayor of the City of Pell City has filed a written statement with the governing body of the municipality, attested by the Clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 2 prior to the deadline and that the name of that person who filed such statement was Cecil L. Fomby.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that Cecil L. Fomby be and he is hereby declared duly elected to the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 2 in the City of Pell City for the term of office commencing on the first Monday of November, 2016; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor of the City of Pell City be and he hereby is directed to issue a certificate of election to Cecil L. Fomby for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 2 for such term pursuant to the provisions of Section 11-46-25, as amended.
On motion of Councilmember Templin, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:
RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4652

A RESOLUTION DECLARING LAURIE MIZE HENDERSON 

DULY ELECTED TO THE OFFICE OF 

PELL CITY BOARD OF EDUCATION – DISTRICT 3 

FOR THE TERM OF OFFICE COMMENCING ON THE FIRST MONDAY OF NOVEMBER 2016

WHEREAS. Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provide for and regular general and special elections in cities and towns of this state, except those cities and towns which have a commission form of government; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-43 of the Alabama Code of 1975 prohibits write-in candidates in elections held under Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-26 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provides that if only one person has filed a statement of candidacy or has been nominated for an office for an election to be held pursuant to Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, at the time the deadline for qualification has passed, then such person shall, for all purposes, be deemed elected to such office, and the mayor or other chief executive officer shall not cause the name of such person or the office for which his candidacy was declared to be printed on the ballot, but he shall immediately file a written statement with the governing body of the municipality attested by the clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy or was nominated for the office preceding the deadline set for an election of municipal officers of the municipality and setting forth the name of such person; and

WHEREAS, said Section 11-46-20, as amended, provides that the governing body of the municipality, after receiving such statement, shall adopt a resolution declaring the person named in the statement duly elected to the office described in the statement, and shall issue a Certificate of Election to such person; and

WHEREAS, the Mayor of the City of Pell City has filed a written statement with the governing body of the municipality, attested by the Clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 3 prior to the deadline and that the name of that person who filed such statement was Laurie Mize Henderson.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that Laurie Mize Henderson be and she is hereby declared duly elected to the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 3 in the City of Pell City for the term of office commencing on the first Monday of November, 2016; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor of the City of Pell City be and he hereby is directed to issue a certificate of election to Laurie Mize Henderson for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 3 for such term pursuant to the provisions of Section 11-46-25, as amended.
On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:

RESOLUTION NO. 2016 – 4653

A RESOLUTION DECLARING TAMMIE WILLIAMS 

DULY ELECTED TO THE OFFICE OF 

PELL CITY BOARD OF EDUCATION – DISTRICT 4 

FOR THE TERM OF OFFICE COMMENCING ON THE FIRST MONDAY OF NOVEMBER 2016

WHEREAS. Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provide for and regular general and special elections in cities and towns of this state, except those cities and towns which have a commission form of government; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-43 of the Alabama Code of 1975 prohibits write-in candidates in elections held under Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended; and

WHEREAS, Section 11-46-26 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, provides that if only one person has filed a statement of candidacy or has been nominated for an office for an election to be held pursuant to Sections 11-46-20 through 11-46-73 of the Alabama Code of 1975, as amended, at the time the deadline for qualification has passed, then such person shall, for all purposes, be deemed elected to such office, and the mayor or other chief executive officer shall not cause the name of such person or the office for which his candidacy was declared to be printed on the ballot, but he shall immediately file a written statement with the governing body of the municipality attested by the clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy or was nominated for the office preceding the deadline set for an election of municipal officers of the municipality and setting forth the name of such person; and

WHEREAS, said Section 11-46-20, as amended, provides that the governing body of the municipality, after receiving such statement, shall adopt a resolution declaring the person named in the statement duly elected to the office described in the statement, and shall issue a Certificate of Election to such person; and

WHEREAS, the Mayor of the City of Pell City has filed a written statement with the governing body of the municipality, attested by the Clerk, certifying the fact that only one person filed a statement of candidacy for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 4 prior to the deadline and that the name of that person who filed such statement was Tammie Williams.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that Tammie Williams be and she is hereby declared duly elected to the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 4 in the City of Pell City for the term of office commencing on the first Monday of November, 2016; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Mayor of the City of Pell City be and he hereby is directed to issue a certificate of election to Tammie Williams for the office of Pell City Board of Education – District 4 for such term pursuant to the provisions of Section 11-46-25, as amended.

On motion of Councilmember Thomas, seconded by Councilmember Templin, the council unanimously approved the revision to the Accounts Payable job description.

On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Jenkins, the council adjourned subject to the call of the Council President.
______________________________

James McGowan
Council President
ATTEST:
______________________________

Penny Isbell

City Clerk
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