STATE OF ALABAMA

ST. CLAIR COUNTY

The City Council of the City of Pell City met in a work session at the City Hall at 4:30 p.m. on Monday, July 27, 2015.  Present were Council President James McGowan, Councilmembers Jay Jenkins, Dot Wood, Sharon Thomas and Terry Templin.  Council President McGowan opened the meeting for discussion.

The invocation was led by Mayor Joe Funderburg.
The pledge to the American flag was led by Councilmember Jay Jenkins.
The City Clerk had roll call for attendance.

Councilmember Thomas stated that everything looked okay with the bills on file with the exception of one vendor.  The vendor had billed the correct amount but incorrectly stated the description of the item purchased.  Chief Burdette stated that he was aware of the mistake and he would have the vendor submit a corrected invoice.  Councilmember Thomas stated that she would like the city to still consider hiring a Purchasing Agent as previously discussed.  City Manager Muenger stated that he had been considering this need and will look at including the position in the next budget year.
Jason Goodgame, Construction Project Manager, gave an update on the Municipal Complex and the Splash Pad.  The in-kind services will be starting on Wednesday with city employees doing a few things before the contractors come on site.  The contractors will be submitting their documents for approval during the next thirty days.  They have asked for some Value Engineering Options that have been addressed.  The General Trades Contactor should be on site within two weeks.  Most of the furniture has been moved out.  They are looking at a completion date on the Library portion around July 5th.  Jason will be presenting a package from the Splash Pad provider for each fixture so that the council can look at it and make comments.  He is looking at a date in March or April of next year for the finished pieces to be delivered.  The Splash Pad should be ready to open thirty days after the pieces are set up and installed.  Everything is going smooth on the project.    
Jim Regan was present to address the council regarding an issue on Blackberry Lane.  Mr. Regan stated that this road is the only access through Valley View Subdivision.  A Trussville resident has erected a gate across the road cutting out the turnaround area at the end of the cul-de-sac.  All the residents feel that this is a public road and wants the city to unblock it.  He stated that the public has had continued use of the road for many years.  It has been paved and maintained by the city.  The circle has always had an unfettered access.  Attorney Erskine Funderburg stated that he had pulled all the real estate records and in 1970, property owners petitioned the county to vacate a portion of the road.  There has never been a dedication or acceptance of the road by the city.  There are also council records from 1982 and 2001 where the city contracted with the county to pave the road.  He advised the residents that this was a private matter.  The concern was emergency vehicles and trash service trucks being able to turn around instead of backing into driveways or backing down the road onto Funderburg Bend Road.  Advanced Disposal will use smaller trucks to service the area but emergency vehicles will have to back down the road.  Council President McGowan stated that he would like to have more discussion to see what the council can do.  He asked City Manager Muenger to look at all options.
Lisa Gaither, Chamber of Commerce Executive Director, requested a Special Events Liquor License for Caribe Club & Marina to serve alcohol at the Blues & Bar-B-Q that will be in conjunction with the Triathlon.  The event will be held at the Pell City Lakeside Park August 15, 2015.  Councilmember Wood stated that she had a problem with it because the event is being held in the park.  The park is a family setting and alcohol should not be served in the park.  Ms. Gaither stated that the alcohol will only be served and consumed in one tent.  They will not be able to walk around in the park with alcohol.  The tent will be close to the stage so the attendees will be able to sit in the tent and listen to the music.  Coolers will not be allowed.  Off-duty police officers will be patrolling the event.  Butts-to-Go will be the barbeque vendor.  No other vendors will be at the event.  Councilmember Jenkins expressed concern that the city was not collecting the appropriate sales tax from vendors that are setting up at different events around the city.  In the future, these events will be looked at more closely to make sure the vendors are obtaining their business license and remitting sales tax as required.   
Park & Recreation Director Bubba Edge requested the council to approve the solicitation of bids on five (5) mowers for the Park & Rec Department.  The current 3-year lease will expire October 1st.  He is looking at three options; $1.00 buy-out Lease, Fair Market Value Lease or purchase.  Once the bids are received, he will make a recommendation on what is the best option.
A proposal from Tyler Technologies on updating the SQL Server at City Hall was presented to the council at the last work session.  Tyler’s quote was $7,689.00.  The council asked Systems Administrator Jay Headrick to get quotes from other vendors.  Mr. Headrick received quotes from Ash Systems in the amount of $10,225.88 and ALW Technologies in the amount of $9,355.62.  In a memo to the council, Mr. Headrick recommended they approve the low quote from Tyler Technologies.
Trobaugh & Company presented an agreement renewal for auditing services in regards to sales tax and business license accounts.  The agreement will be for a three-year term at an hourly rate of $86.00 per hour beginning August 1st.
Bids received on 2015 Fall Sports Uniforms.  Mr. Edge recommended the low bid from B & S Sporting Goods.  Bids received were as follows:
	
	 B & S 
	 ATC Grafix 
	 RAGLAND 
	 SOUTHERN 
	WOLF CREEK
	Opportunity Center
	Mordecai

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Baseball
	
	
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Jerseys-Adult
	$15.35 
	$20.00 
	    
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys-Youth
	$14.45 
	$19.00 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Hats
	$11.75 
	$12.65 
	    
	   
	
	
	

	Socks
	$3.60 
	$5.39 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	   
	
	
	

	Soccer
	
	
	
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys-Girls & Boys Travel-Adult
	$17.50 
	$20.00 
	
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys-Girls & Boys Travel-Youth
	$16.95 
	$19.00 
	
	   
	
	
	

	Shorts - Girls & Boys Travel Adult
	$10.95 
	$12.50 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Shorts - Girls & Boys Travel Youth
	$10.25 
	$11.55 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - Travel Adult
	$3.60 
	$4.04 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - Travel Youth
	$3.60 
	$3.75 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - Travel Junior
	$3.60 
	$3.75 
	
	
	
	
	

	Jerseys - In House Adult
	$15.25 
	$34.50 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys - In HouseYouth
	$14.95 
	$31.65 
	
	   
	
	
	

	Shorts - In House Adult
	$9.25 
	$9.38 
	
	   
	
	
	

	Shorts - In HouseYouth
	$8.95 
	$8.29 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - In House Adult
	$3.60 
	$4.04 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - In House Youth
	$3.60 
	$3.75 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - In House Junior
	$3.60 
	$3.75 
	
	   
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	   
	
	
	

	Softball
	
	
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Jerseys - Adult
	$18.15 
	$18.30 
	
	
	
	
	

	Jerseys - Youth
	$17.35 
	$16.90 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Pants - Adult
	$19.99 
	$24.95 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Pants - Youth
	$19.55 
	$23.62 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - Junior
	$4.50 
	$5.39 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - Youth
	$4.50 
	$5.39 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Socks - Adult
	$4.50 
	$5.39 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	
	
	
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Football
	
	
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys - Adult
	$23.99 
	$21.15 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys - Youth
	$22.93 
	$19.63 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Pants - Adult
	$23.25 
	$25.00 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Pants - Youth
	$22.45 
	$24.00 
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Basketball
	
	
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys - Adult
	$15.25 
	$35.00 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Jerseys - Youth
	$14.45 
	$33.00 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Shorts - Adult
	$12.99 
	$26.00 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Shorts - Youth
	$12.75 
	$25.00 
	   
	   
	
	
	

	
	
	
	   
	   
	
	
	

	Cheerleading
	
	
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	 NO BID 
	NO BID
	NO BID

	Top - Adult
	$34.73 
	$34.53 
	
	
	
	
	

	Top - Youth
	$34.73 
	$34.53 
	
	
	
	
	

	Skirt - Adult
	$24.72 
	$26.53 
	
	
	
	
	

	Skirt - Youth
	$24.72 
	$26.53 
	
	
	
	
	

	Briefs - Adult
	$6.65 
	$6.65 
	
	
	
	
	

	Briefs - Youth
	$6.65 
	$6.65 
	
	
	
	
	

	Poms
	 $11.55 each 
	 $12.50 each 
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


City Manager Muenger recommended to the council that the city cancel the agreement with ASPCI effective October 1, 2015.  ASPCI has attempted to negotiate with St. Clair County on additional funding.  The county has asked the City to assume operations of the facility and the county would work with the City.  ASPCI has contracts with other municipalities who are willing to also work with the City.  Mr. Muenger has looked at the numbers and developed a plan for the City to take over the operations.  He is asking the council to end the contract and move forward with the City assuming the running of the shelter or contracting the services out.  LeAnn Brooks from Springville was present to address the council.  She is a volunteer at the shelter and is concerned that the employees of the shelter will not be able to find employment.  She would like the council to reconsider their decision to assume operations or at least give the current employees a chance to apply for positions once the City takes over.
Mr. Muenger stated that the services ASPCI attempted to provide and what the City attempts will be the same in providing what is best for the citizens.  He commended ASPCI for what they have done.  He would like the City to take over on a shorter time frame.  He would also like to extend an invitation to all of the volunteers and everyone else to continue working with the City.
Mayor Funderburg commended the employees from the Park & Rec Department, Fire Department, Police Department, Street Department and Dawn Childre for all the hard work they put in on the “Bulls on the Lake” Rodeo.  The rodeo was a tremendous success.  $4,000.00 was raised for the Muscular Dystrophy Foundation. 
There being no further items to discuss, Council President McGowan adjourned the work session.

The City Council of the City of Pell City met in regular session at the City Hall at 6:00 p.m. on Monday, July 27, 2015.  Present were Council President James McGowan, Councilmembers Jay Jenkins, Dot Wood, Sharon Thomas and Terry Templin.  Those present constituting the entirety of the council, the following business was transacted:

The City Clerk had roll call for attendance.

On motion of Councilmember Thomas, seconded by Councilmember Templin, the council unanimously approved the payment of bills on file.

On motion of Councilmember Templin, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council approved the Special Events Liquor License for the Chamber of Commerce Blues & BBQ to be held at Lakeside Park August 14 & 15th.  On roll call vote, those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmembers Jenkins, Thomas and Templin.  Nays:  Councilmember Wood.

On motion of Councilmember Jenkins, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the solicitation of bids on five mowers for the Park & Rec Department.  

Resolution No. 2015 – 4470 was tabled from the last council meeting in order to get quotes from other vendors.  On motion of Councilmember Thomas, seconded by Councilmember Wood, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:

RESOLUTION NO. 2015 – 4470

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AN AGREEMENT WITH TYLER TECHNOLOGIES FOR THE SQL SERVER MIGRATION

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has determined that it is wise, prudent, and in the best interests of the City to update the SQL Server at City Hall; and

WHEREAS, Tyler Technologies has presented a proposal to perform the migration services which is attached hereto as Exhibit “A” and expressly incorporated herein by reference.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Manager be, and he hereby is, authorized to sign said agreement with Tyler Technologies for the services proposed herein.
On motion of Councilmember Jenkins, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:

RESOLUTION NO. 2015 – 4484

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY OF PELL CITY

TO ENTER INTO A PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AGREEMENT WITH TROBAUGH AND COMPANY, LLC
WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Pell City desires to retain professional audit services to assist the City in connection with the Local Tax Procedures Act of 1998, as codified in the Alabama Code, including, but not limited to, work performed in connection with the  verification of records relating to contracts, subcontracts, purchase invoices, sales invoices, leases and other data pertaining to certain fees and taxes which may be payable to the City, including, business licenses, occupational taxes, sales taxes, use taxes, lease/rental taxes, lodging taxes and other taxes, building permits and franchise fees; and,

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is wise, prudent, and in the best interests of the citizens of Pell City to enter into a professional services agreement with Trobaugh and Company, LLC to provide said professional audit services for the City.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City, Alabama, as follows:

Section 1.  That the City Manager be, and he hereby is, authorized to enter into a professional services agreement in form and substance as the agreement attached hereto as Exhibit A, and expressly incorporated herein by reference, with Trobaugh and Company, LLC to provide professional audit services to assist the City in connection with the Local Tax Procedures Act of 1998, as codified in the Alabama Code, including, but not limited to, the services set forth above.
On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution:

RESOLUTION NO. 2015 – 4485

A RESOLUTION AWARDING THE BID FOR THE PURCHASE OF CERTAIN UNIFORMS FOR THE YOUTH SPORTS LEAGUES ADMINISTERED BY THE CITY

WHEREAS, the City of Pell City has taken and received competitive sealed bids for the purchase of certain uniforms to be used in the fall youth sports leagues administered by the Pell City Parks & Recreation Department, which equipment is more particularly described in the exhibit attached hereto as Exhibit “A”; and

WHEREAS, the lowest bid that met the specifications established by the City was submitted by B&S Sporting Goods in the amounts detailed in the attached bid tabulation sheet, which is attached hereto as Exhibit “B” and expressly incorporated herein by reference.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City that the City awards the bid for the purchase of the above-described uniforms to be used in the City’s fall youth sports leagues to B&S Sporting Goods in the amounts detailed in the attached bid tabulation sheet, which is attached hereto as Exhibit “B” and expressly incorporated herein by reference.

On motion of Councilmember Templin, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council unanimously approved the following resolution.  On roll call vote, those voting aye being:  Council President McGowan, Councilmembers Jenkins, Wood, Thomas and Templin.  Nays:  None.
RESOLUTION NO. 2015 – 4486

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE NON-RENEWAL
OF THE AGREEMENT FOR THE CARE AND DISPOSAL OF ANIMALS WITHIN THE CITY OF PELL CITY
WHEREAS, on October 1, 2013, the City of Pell City entered into a certain Agreement for the Care and Disposal of Animals within the City of Pell City, Alabama and Commercial Lease (collectively “the Agreement”) with the Animal Shelter of Pell City, Inc. (“ASPCI”); and, 

WHEREAS, pursuant to the Agreement, ASPCI agreed to operate an animal impoundment facility owned by the City and agreed to receive, care for, and humanely dispose of stray or unclaimed animals presented to ASPCI by the City; and,

WHEREAS, in addition to its contract with the City, ASPCI contracts with the St. Clair County Commission and other local municipalities to provide animal impoundment services; and,

WHEREAS, ASPCI has informed the St. Clair County Commission and the City that ASPCI cannot continue to operate the City’s animal impoundment facility unless the County Commission significantly increases the funding it provides to ASPCI; and,

WHEREAS, the City has been informed by the St. Clair County Commission that the Commission cannot agree to the funding increase requested by ASPCI; and,

WHEREAS, the City’s Agreement with ASPCI shall automatically renew under the same terms and conditions unless the City provides sixty (60) days’ written notice prior to the renewal date of the Agreement of the City’s intent to non-renew and cancel the Agreement; and,

WHEREAS, given ASPCI’s position that it cannot properly operate the City’s animal impoundment facility without a significant increase in compensation from the St. Clair County Commission, and the Commission’s indication that it cannot agree to ASPCI’s request, the City Council of the City of Pell City has determined that it is wise, prudent, and in the best interests of the citizens of Pell City to non-renew and cancel the City’s Agreement with ASPCI and to authorize the City Manager to develop and implement a plan to assume operation and control of the City’s animal impoundment facility.
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Pell City, Alabama, as follows:

1. That the recitals set forth in the foregoing preambles are hereby found and declared to be true and correct and are expressly adopted herein by reference.

2. That the City Manager be, and he hereby is, authorized to deliver written notice of the City’s intention to non-renew and cancel the Agreement for the Care and Disposal of Animals within the City of Pell City, Alabama and Commercial Lease by and between the City of Pell City, Alabama, and ASPCI.  
3. That the City Manager be, and he hereby is, authorized to develop and implement a plan to assume operation and control of the City’s animal impoundment facility, including, but not limited to, negotiating with the St. Clair County Commission and other local municipalities to enter into contracts with the City for the receipt, care, and humane disposal of stray or unclaimed animals delivered to the City’s animal impoundment facility by said governmental entity.
4. That the City Manager shall present any said contracts negotiated with the St. Clair County Commission and other local municipalities for approval by the City Council upon the completion of said negotiations.
On motion of Councilmember Wood, seconded by Councilmember Thomas, the council adjourned subject to the call of the Council President.
______________________________

James McGowan
Council President
ATTEST:

______________________________

Penny Isbell

City Clerk

